
The North 
Wales Regional 
Transport Plan
Our draft Regional Transport Plan outlines the vision,  
objectives, and strategic policies and interventions for improving  
the transport network in North Wales over the next five years.   

We want to create a safe, sustainable, 
affordable, resilient, and effective 
integrated transport network that 
supports economic growth, prosperity, 
and well-being in North Wales. Our 
objectives are clear: to improve digital 
connectivity and local services, enhance 
accessibility and transport choice, enable 
decarbonisation through the transition 
to a zero-emission fleet, and foster 
sustainable and inclusive economic 
growth. 

Our draft Regional Transport Plan 
captures the unique challenges and 
opportunities for North Wales and 
outlines our strategic policies and 
interventions across various modes 
of transport, including rail, road, bus, 
walking and cycling. We recognise that 
having access to accurate and up to date 
information at the touch of a button can 
modernise and transform commuter 
experience therefore the significance  
of digital connectivity is amplified 
in our draft Plan.  

Our proposals also focus on behaviour 
change and reducing the need to travel 
by car, for example by better integrating 
transport with economic development 
and land use planning. We also consider 
the needs of our energy systems as we 
increase our reliance on alternative 
sustainable fuel sources, such as electric 
vehicles.  

This consultation and supporting draft 
documents represent the collective 
efforts of the North Wales Corporate 
Joint Committee, its Transport Sub-
Committee, and our partners, including 
local authorities, Transport for Wales, 
the Welsh Government and Arup - who 
have provided expert advice to inform its 
development. We now want your views 
on our proposals to help us shape and 
progress our plans.  


